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A riveting mystery that recalls the work of Umberto Eco and Barry Unsworth, A Stolen Tongue is the
captivating debut novel that launched critically acclaimed author Sheri Holman's literary career.

In 1483, Father Felix Fabri sails from Germany to Mount Sinai on a pilgrimage to venerate the relics of Saint
Katherine of Alexandria. But at each of the shrines he visits throughout Greece and Palestine, he finds that
the remains of Katherine's body are being stolen piece by piece: Her hand, her ear, and then her tongue
vanish from their holy resting places. Desperate to discover the thief and save his saint from such appalling
desecration, Felix is thrust into a strange mystery that takes him across the desert and plumbs the depths of
his soul.
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Valles:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book entitled A Stolen
Tongue? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time along with
your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have other opinion?

Kristen Hamilton:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information these days can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take A Stolen Tongue as your daily resource information.

Brian Rankins:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you
need to do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to have a look at some books. On the list of
books in the top record in your reading list is definitely A Stolen Tongue. This book which can be qualified
as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking up and review this
publication you can get many advantages.

Clyde Okane:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of
news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the A Stolen Tongue when you needed it?
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