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Featuring expert contributors from around the world, this book offers insight into the vital theoretical and
practical aspects of the economics of copyright. Topics discussed include fair use, performers rights,
copyright and trade, online music streaming, internet piracy, copyright and visual art markets, and open
source publishing. In addition to in-depth coverage of these timely topics, the authors also offer insightful
predictions and policy recommendations for the future.

Each of the self-contained chapters is written by a distinguished expert and is pitched at a level designed to
be accessible to advanced undergraduate and postgraduate students in economics and law. As a whole, the
book covers all of the topical content that a student of copyright economics should know. Teachers and
lecturers will find all the required material to provide a comprehensive overview of the subject in a single
volume. For scholars with a legal background, the book will also act as an effective introduction or refresher
in the economic theory underlying copyright.

Contributors: D.S. Banerjee, W.J. Gordon, P.J.Heald, S.J. Liebowitz, S.E. Margolis, F. Mueller-Langer, E.
Rosati, S.F. Schwemer, R. Towse, M. Waldman, R. Watt
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From reader reviews:

Donna Beckman:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book Handbook on the Economics of
Copyright: A Guide for Students and Teachers will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel far more
confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think that will open or reading some sort of
book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you seeking best
book or appropriate book with you?

Adrian Kao:

The book Handbook on the Economics of Copyright: A Guide for Students and Teachers will bring you to
definitely the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique.
When you try to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book Handbook on the
Economics of Copyright: A Guide for Students and Teachers is much recommended to you to learn. You can
also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Mike Edwards:

The book Handbook on the Economics of Copyright: A Guide for Students and Teachers has a lot details on
it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous
author. The writer makes some research before write this book. That book very easy to read you can obtain
the point easily after scanning this book.

Helen Butts:

The book untitled Handbook on the Economics of Copyright: A Guide for Students and Teachers contain a
lot of information on this. The writer explains the woman idea with easy means. The language is very clear
to see all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous
author. The author provides you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because
you can keep reading your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If
you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice go
through.
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