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In the spirit of her blockbuster #1 New York Times bestseller The Happiness Project, Gretchen Rubin
embarks on a new project to make home a happier place.
 
One Sunday afternoon, as she unloaded the dishwasher, Gretchen Rubin felt hit by a wave of homesickness.
Homesick—why? She was standing right in her own kitchen. She felt homesick, she realized, with love for
home itself. “Of all the elements of a happy life,” she thought, “my home is the most important.” In a flash,
she decided to undertake a new happiness project, and this time, to focus on home.

And what did she want from her home? A place that calmed her, and energized her. A place that, by making
her feel safe, would free her to take risks. Also, while Rubin wanted to be happier at home, she wanted to
appreciate how much happiness was there already.
 
So, starting in September (the new January), Rubin dedicated a school year—September through May—to
making her home a place of greater simplicity, comfort, and love. 
 
In The Happiness Project, she worked out general theories of happiness. Here she goes deeper on factors that
matter for home, such as possessions, marriage, time, and parenthood. How can she control the cubicle in her
pocket? How might she spotlight her family’s treasured possessions? And it really was time to replace that
dud toaster.
 
Each month, Rubin tackles a different theme as she experiments with concrete, manageable resolutions—and
this time, she coaxes her family to try some resolutions, as well. 
 
With her signature blend of memoir, science, philosophy, and experimentation, Rubin’s passion for her
subject jumps off the page, and reading just a few chapters of this book will inspire readers to find more
happiness in their own lives. 
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From reader reviews:

Ilene Venne:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students as they are still students or this for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby per other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't need
do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Happier at Home: Kiss More, Jump
More, Abandon Self-Control, and My Other Experiments in Everyday Life. All type of book could you see
on many resources. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Lenore Cortez:

The publication untitled Happier at Home: Kiss More, Jump More, Abandon Self-Control, and My Other
Experiments in Everyday Life is the publication that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality
of the reserve content that will be shown to a person. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are
easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of research when write the book, and so the information
that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Happier at Home:
Kiss More, Jump More, Abandon Self-Control, and My Other Experiments in Everyday Life from the
publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Adam McGrath:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its protect may doesn't work
here is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside
search likes. Maybe you answer is usually Happier at Home: Kiss More, Jump More, Abandon Self-Control,
and My Other Experiments in Everyday Life why because the fantastic cover that make you consider
regarding the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or
even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to pick up this book.

Alejandro Colon:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is Happier at Home: Kiss More, Jump More, Abandon Self-Control, and My
Other Experiments in Everyday Life this book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this
world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The words styles that
writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this
book. That's why this book suited all of you.
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