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Gain a deeper understanding & appreciation of the Holy Quran!

Book includes:

Commentary on 100+ verses of the Holy Quran demonstrating the praise of the Holy Prophet.

Covering famous events in the Holy Prophet’s life, including his creation, advent, childhood, Ascension
(Mi’raj), rank on the Day of Judgment, etc. along with many of his qualities, such as his miracles,
knowledge, status, authority, praiseworthiness, character, etc.

Referencing major works throughout Islamic History, including Bukhari, Muslim, Tirmidhi, Tafseer Kabeer,
Tafseer Roohul-Bayaan, Khazaainul-Irfaan, Madaarijun-Nubuwwah, and many others.

Book also includes two supplementary commentaries dealing with the Friends of Allah (Subhanahu wa
Ta'ala) and the Martyrs of Islam, both substantiated from the Quran.

Learn of the matchless relationship between the Creator and His Beloved Muhammad (Sallalaahu Alaihi
Wasallam) from the words of Allah (Azzawajall) Himself!
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Barnes:

The Beloved's Majesty - Quranic Verses in Praise of the Holy Prophet can be one of your basic books that
are good idea. We recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can increase
your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The writer
giving his/her effort to get every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing The Beloved's Majesty -
Quranic Verses in Praise of the Holy Prophet yet doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the
hottest in addition to based confirm resource information that maybe you can be considered one of it. This
great information could drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial pondering.

Christian Fowler:

You could spend your free time to learn this book this guide. This The Beloved's Majesty - Quranic Verses
in Praise of the Holy Prophet is simple bringing you can read it in the park, in the beach, train in addition to
soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy typically the e-
book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. So there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Harry Oliver:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our know-how for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This e-book The Beloved's Majesty - Quranic Verses in Praise of the Holy Prophet was filled
in relation to science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific research
competence. Some people has different feel when they reading any book. If you know how big selling point
of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get
book which you wanted.

Kent Dennis:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is published or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just seeking the The Beloved's Majesty - Quranic Verses in Praise of the Holy Prophet when you needed
it?
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