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Young, ambitious, and beautiful, Hatsy Hall protects her broken heart by throwing herself into being the best
property manager in all of Silicon Valley. After her fiancé abandons her at the alter, Hatsy decides to
prioritize work over anything remotely resembling love.

So Hatsy devotes herself to managing the prestigious, Arboretum apartment complex in Cupertino,
dedicating her time and energy to guiding her staff and balancing the comfort and needs of her tenants. Her
good work catches the eye of the corporate office in New York City, propelling Hatsy’s career to even
greater heights when they view her as a team leader in their green building global expansion.

But love has a way of finding us even when we don’t want it to, and before long, Hatsy is torn between
meeting her career goals and following her heart. New York beckons her, but does California hold something
to keep her? Will Hatsy allow love to rearrange her life and her heart?

A charming story about growing up, discovering your way in life, and saying “yes” to love, Hat Trick
features a loveable heroine and a delightful ensemble cast of characters who will keep you turning the pages
long into the night.
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From reader reviews:

Curt Hall:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A guide Hat Trick will make you to possibly be
smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think
in which open or reading any book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they could be thought
like that? Have you seeking best book or acceptable book with you?

Clarence Jenkins:

This Hat Trick book is not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you
get by reading this book will be information inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get information
which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This specific Hat Trick without we
know teach the one who reading it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Hat
Trick can bring once you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' become full because you can have
it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Hat Trick having great arrangement in word in addition to layout,
so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Rebecca Goza:

The guide with title Hat Trick includes a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of
benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the information that exist in this
book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the
improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth.
You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Sherry Nicholson:

You may get this Hat Trick by look at the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your
solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only through
written or printed and also can you enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just
looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways
to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your
knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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