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CLAN - Season 1: Calum’s Sword. Episode 1 of 12 rip-roaring adventures following a true hero in a time of
war.

"A edge-of-your-seat Saturday matinee!"

Now in the hugely successful Bitesize Read format - a 1-hour read.

Calum Maclean is a sword-for-hire and a thorn in the side of anyone who sets himself up as Authority.

He returns to the Highlands from the war in Flanders where he fought for the English, for a price, to find
Bonnie Prince Charlie has arrived and war with the English is inevitable.

Everyone thinks Calum will obey the Pretender.

Everyone is wrong. Calum Maclean tips his hat to no man.

When his former love asks him to fetch her man from the English army, he accepts without hesitation. It's a
noble cause, and Calum can't resist a noble cause. Even if it might cost him his life.

The journey has begun!
_______________________________

A wee note: Clan was inspired by the great Bernard Cornwell’s Sharpe stories. Though historical accurate,
it’s not a Historical Novel, it’s a roller-coaster adventure in 12 1-hour episodes. Each one a complete story
with a beginning, middle and end. And a cliff-hanger, in the true tradition of the Saturday Matinee genre.

Reviews:
“A series of Saturday matinees! Brilliant! Pure escapism, and great fun.”

“If you enjoyed following the adventures of Richard Sharpe and his sidekick, Partrick, then you'll enjoy
Calum and Big John.”

“Looking forward to reading the rest of this series. Would recommend it to anyone interested in this time
period of Scottish history!”

“OK it’s not Bernard Cornwell, but it never said it was – it’s just a great read I highly recommend”

“Great!”

“Good fast read with plenty of tension. Look forward to the next episode. Have got the next three episodes
on kindle.”



“Can't wait to read the next one - Hope there is more to come in the series and life of Calum Maclean”
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From reader reviews:

Joshua Parsons:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure than other is
high. For yourself who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular Calum's Sword - Inspired by
the great Bernard Cornwell Sharpe: Episode 1 (Clan) book as nice and daily reading reserve. Why, because
this book is more than just a book.

David Barnett:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire all their
reader with their story as well as their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they
write about advantage about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet
always try to improve their talent in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their
book. One of them is this Calum's Sword - Inspired by the great Bernard Cornwell Sharpe: Episode 1 (Clan).

Jay Klein:

You can obtain this Calum's Sword - Inspired by the great Bernard Cornwell Sharpe: Episode 1 (Clan) by
browse the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve problem if you get
difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only through written or printed and
also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking from your
mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about
your e-book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try
to choose correct ways for you.

Silvia Doucet:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled update of
news. In this particular modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person.
From media social just like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just seeking the Calum's Sword - Inspired by the great Bernard Cornwell Sharpe: Episode 1
(Clan) when you required it?
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