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Helena “Dray” Draybeck is a cocky military brat, and Jordan Bowers is the daughter of a high ranking
ambassador. Both want to be top pilots when they finish fighter pilot training at a Terran military space
station. Both live under the shadow of very different family legacies. Just when it looks like smooth sailing
for their success as cadets and their growing attraction to each other, the Novans declare war. Dray and
Jordan now have to survive an acceleration to active duty and a dangerous secret that threatens their
happiness together. They learn that the enemy has many faces.
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From reader reviews:

Jon Gonzalez:

The knowledge that you get from Face of the Enemy may be the more deep you looking the information that
hide in the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to be
aware of but Face of the Enemy giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in
particular way that can be understood by simply anyone who read that because the author of this book is
well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. That makes
it easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for
having this particular Face of the Enemy instantly.

Nancy Sherman:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with
their family, or their own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to
beach, or picnic within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to
something different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be
option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of publication
that you should read. If you want to try look for book, may be the reserve untitled Face of the Enemy can be
good book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

William Marsh:

Exactly why? Because this Face of the Enemy is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication
waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will zap you with the secret that inside. Reading this book
adjacent to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside
easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a
lot of rewards than the other book possess such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking
technique. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I have been you I will go to the book store
hurriedly.

Douglas Brim:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Face of the Enemy
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.
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