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Sport is big business; international in nature and the focus of much media and cultural attention. In this Very
Short Introduction, Mike Cronin charts the history of sport, from its traditional origins in folk football and
cock fighting to its position as a global phenomenon today. Looking at a variety of sports from team games
such as rugby, cricket, and football to games for individuals such as golf, tennis, and skiing, he considers
how these first emerged
and captivated the interest of ordinary people, and how sport has been transformed within our daily lives.

Exploring the relationship between sport and class, gender, commerce, identity, and ethics, Cronin considers
some of the central issues in sport today, including the high pay of professional footballers and the glamour
of sports women, as well as fair play standards. Charting sport through the ages and around the world, this is
a short guide to the history, development, and place of sport in contemporary global society.

ABOUT THE SERIES: The Very Short Introductions series from Oxford University Press contains hundreds
of titles in almost every subject area. These pocket-sized books are the perfect way to get ahead in a new
subject quickly. Our expert authors combine facts, analysis, perspective, new ideas, and enthusiasm to make
interesting and challenging topics highly readable.
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From reader reviews:

Irene Holmes:

Do you among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This Sport: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) book is readable by
you who hate the straight word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable looking at
experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer involving
Sport: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) content conveys the idea easily to understand by
many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different in the form of it. So ,
do you even now thinking Sport: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) is not loveable to be
your top record reading book?

Karolyn Kaufman:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can satisfy
your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be study.
Sport: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) can be your answer as it can be read by a person
who have those short time problems.

Rose Watkins:

This Sport: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) is brand new way for you who has
curiosity to look for some information as it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting
knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having bit of digest in reading this Sport: A Very Short
Introduction (Very Short Introductions) can be the light food for you personally because the information
inside this specific book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books develop itself in the form which can
be reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in publication form
make them feel sleepy even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there is not any in reading a publication
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss it! Just
read this e-book style for your better life and also knowledge.

Mary Wines:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some
people likes looking at, not only science book and also novel and Sport: A Very Short Introduction (Very
Short Introductions) or others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the fantastic a
book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or maybe students
especially. Those textbooks are helping them to increase their knowledge. In various other case, beside
science e-book, any other book likes Sport: A Very Short Introduction (Very Short Introductions) to make



your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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