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Always in the process of becoming, inherently incomplete, the child is a remarkably malleable figure. In
Figurations, Claudia Castañeda shows how this malleability is itself generated—how the child is "made" by
different constituencies and how the resulting historically, geographically, and culturally specific figures are
put to widely divergent uses, often to very powerful effect. Situated at the intersection of feminist,
postcolonial, cultural, and science and technology studies, this book provides a remarkable map of the child's
meaning and movement across transnational circuits of exchange.
Castañeda investigates the construction of the child as both a natural and cultural body, the character of its
embodiment, and its imaginative appeal in various settings. The sites through which she tracks the bodily
production and deployment of the child include nineteenth-century developmental science; cognitive
neuroscience in the late twentieth century; international adoption; rumors and media coverage of child-organ
stealing; and poststructuralist theory. Her work reveals the extent to which the child's cultural significance
and value lie in its status as a body whose incompleteness makes it "available" for such varied uses.
Figurations establishes the child as a key figure for understanding and rethinking the politics of nature,
culture, bodies, and subjects in changing "global" worlds.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Frey:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Figurations: Child,
Bodies, Worlds (Next Wave: New Directions in Women's Studies). All type of book are you able to see on
many solutions. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Teresa Raap:

The book untitled Figurations: Child, Bodies, Worlds (Next Wave: New Directions in Women's Studies)
contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy technique. The language
is very straightforward all the people, so do not worry, you can easy to read this. The book was authored by
famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. You can easily read this book
because you can read more your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book inside anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice
study.

Mary Larrick:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a publication we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This e-book Figurations: Child, Bodies, Worlds (Next Wave: New Directions in
Women's Studies) was filled in relation to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your
science competence. Some people has various feel when they reading the book. If you know how big benefit
from a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book
that you wanted.

Frances Fortier:

Some individuals said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt it when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book Figurations: Child, Bodies, Worlds (Next Wave:
New Directions in Women's Studies) to make your reading is interesting. Your skill of reading skill is
developing when you like reading. Try to choose simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the
idea about book and examining especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and
read it. Beside that the reserve Figurations: Child, Bodies, Worlds (Next Wave: New Directions in Women's
Studies) can to be your new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information must you're
doing of these time.
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